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For Immediate Release: 
 

Tom Rasmussen joins Cabrera Capital Markets as Head 
of Municipal Sales, Trading, and Underwriting 

 
New York City – May 20, 2024 – Today Cabrera Capital Markets announced the newest Managing 
Director and Head of Municipal Sales, Trading, and Underwriting, Tom Rasmussen. Rasmussen will 
be based in New York City and is a seasoned finance professional with over 35 years of experience 
in municipal research sales and trading. One of his many roles in over three decades at Citigroup 
was leading Citi’s Institutional Municipal Bond Sales team. 
 
“We are continuing our commitment to grow our Municipal Department by hiring established 
proven leaders in our industry” said Founder and CEO, Martin Cabrera Jr. “Tom Rasmussen has 
extensive experience in the U.S. municipal sector and globally, allowing Cabrera to expand on a 
larger scale.”  
 
Tom Rasmussen was most recently the Managing Director of Municipal Capital Solutions and Debt 
Capital Markets at Citigroup. In this role he developed extensive experience managing U.S. and 
global municipal financial services including sales, trading, asset management and product 
development as well as expertise with client relationship building and credit analysis. 
 
“Tom’s stellar reputation at Citigroup precedes him and we are excited to have him lead our 
municipal sales, trading, underwriting efforts” said Mario Carrasco, Managing Director, and Head of 
Public Finance. “We are proud of our Municipal team’s recent growth and trajectory at Cabrera 
Capital, and Tom’s proven leadership in municipal sales adds another level of expertise to build 
upon the existing expansion.”  
 
Cabrera Capital’s Municipal teams work extensively with municipalities across the country 
including in New York, Illinois, Texas, and California.  
 
About Cabrera Capital Markets  
 
Cabrera Capital Markets – founded in 2001 – is an investment bank and institutional brokerage firm 
providing investment banking for municipal, corporate, and advisory clients, institutional brokerage 
services for municipal bonds, global equities, taxable fixed income securities, preferred equities, and 
structured products, as well as cash management services. Cabrera’s diversified global client base  
includes corporations, municipalities, financial institutions, federal agencies, unions, pension funds, 
foundations, and endowments.  
 
More information about Cabrera can be found at www.cabreracapital.com.  
 

http://www.cabreracapital.com/
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